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EVERYONE now recognizes the importance 
of 'environmental issues' in contemporary 
politics. But what are the political process­
es by which such issues get defined and 
placed on the policy agenda? What exact­
ly is the 'environmental movement'? Are 
green parties the harbingers of far-reach­
ing change, or merely temporary curiosi­
ties? Do green ideas add up to a coherent 
political theory? 

These are the questions with which 
Environmental Politics is concerned. Its 
particular specialism is the study of the 
environmental movement and green par­
ties in industrialized countries: in just two 
years it has become the principal forum 
for scholarly debate in this field. 

In the analysis of policy, Environmental 
Politics has more competition from other 

journals, but its focus on the political 
dynamics of change - on issues such as 
Antarctica, protection of whales and the 
development of environmental regulation 
in the United Kingdom - provides a 
valuable complement to the more techni­
cal orientation found elsewhere. 

Perhaps surprisingly, the journal has 
not yet sustained a vigorous debate in the 
field of green political theory. Another 
criticism might be the exclusive focus on 
the industrialized countries. Many of the 
most interesting and important develop­
ments in environmental politics are now 
taking place in the South; and, as the 1992 
'Earth Summit' in Rio de Janeiro showed, 
it is vital that Northern commentators and 
politicians understand the perspective of 
developing countries. 

Unusually for an academic journal, 
Environmental Politics includes short, 
newsy papers (up to 2,000 words) covering 
recent political events and developments. 
Subjects have included the fortunes of 
green parties in elections in Germany, 
France, Italy, the United Kingdom, Aus­
tralia and elsewhere; the activities of 
green members of the Tasmanian, Belgian 
and European parliaments; and contro­
versies such as President Bill Clinton's 
environmental policies, dams on the 
Danube and the Amsterdam 'car-free city' 
referendum. 

These succinct analyses are an indis­
pensable fund of information that should 
give the journal a readership among 
nonspecialists and students. Its compre-

hensive book reviews are also an 
invaluable resource. 

Altogether, the increasing importance 
of its subject and the high quality of its 
contents make this journal an essential 
requirement on the shelves of any self­
respecting environmental library. 

By contrast, Greener Management Inter­
national is an odd beast. A product of the 
recent boom in publications on the 'green­
ing of business', it seems to fall between 
the stools of a popular magazine and an 
academic journal. 

It contains studies of particular 
companies' environmental strategies, arti­
cles on general topics such as environ­
mental technologies, and policy analyses 
from a business perspective. But the 
papers are too simple and short (6-10 
pages) to be of much use to management 
studies scholars - these issues are now 
well covered in specialist management 
journals. More general readers from with­
in the business world will find material of 
interest - there is a repeated listing of 
green business clubs, and a belated sum­
mary of international environmental news 
- but the price and slim contents do not 
seem designed to attract them. 

There is a great need for business man­
agers to get advice on environmental good 
practice and to learn from the experience 
of others; but I doubt that this publication 
will prove to be the means. D 
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